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Say no To GMO

In news:

GEAC Approval to GM
Mustard

Know about Mustard



Points in favour

Nearly all the corn and soyabean grown in 
the US and Canada are GM crops 

Millennia before Gregor Mendel conducted 
his pea plant experiments in the 1850s, 
farmers knew that crossbreeding of plants, 
and animals, could produce certain desirable 
traits. 

Inter-species hybridisation and inter-generic 
hybridisation are also happening in nature.Ex
Maize, Triticale, 



 developed by our own scientists

Herbicide resistance is developed all over
the world in soyabean, cotton, maize and
many other crops. Crop with minimum tillage
and less use of fuel

No genetic erosion: NBPGR

Benefit to farmers: Ex GM Cotton

Contd…



Can have long term effects which may not 
be visible at the present moment

According to Roderigues, GM crops 
contaminate nearby plants, endangering 
biodiversity

Most of the countries that have higher 
cotton yields than India do not grow GM 
cotton

Opposition



HT: & Health->A scientific report from 
Argentina found a fourfold increase in birth 
defects and a threefold increase in childhood 
cancers in HT soya areas. Shockingly, the 
GEAC has conveniently omitted to have any 
herbicide-related studies.

Gt-tolrant crop promotes constant exposure 
to a single herbicide — which eventually 
results in weeds becoming resistant

CHALLENGE TO TIES



Considering the less productivity of crops in
India and imperative of increasing farmers
income GM crops must be promoted.” Criticall
analyse.

QUESTION



➢Terror has aimed to unleash maximum panic
and thereby create divisions in societies,
challenge the public’s faith in their
institutions and trigger ethnic, racial or
religious tensions.

➢IS returnee and challenge

Horror in Manchester



A flawed rescue act

The commendation: Army

Decoding the Saharanpur clashes

Employees of Lower courts


